V SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT DIVISION
L\'ﬁ\‘( Spreadsheet
INVITATION TO TENDER NUMBER 25-175

OTTAWA-CAR]

LA oD Asphalt Paving - Phase Il

Brenning Construction

A & B Paving Ontario

Canada Paving &

Prestige Design and

School (1986) Ltd. Corp Construction (1998) Limited | Construction (Ottawa) Ltd. Black Tar Corp. 1457478 Ontario Inc

Brookfield High School $ 88,608.10 $79,999.00 No Bid $114,550.00 No Bid $ 168,000.00
Devonshire Community Public School $32,092.04 $24,999.00 $31,900.00 $ 43,100.00 $30,546.00 $ 16,069.00
Earl of March Secondary School $28,187.00 $15,999.00 $24,990.00 $53,740.00 $29,172.00 $ 15,586.00
Nepean High School $138,863.15 $177,950.00 $167,900.00 $176,995.00 No Bid $ 195,000.00
Broadview Public School $ 16,985.73 $11,999.00 $ 15,990.00 $32,169.00 $24,042.00 $11,874.00
Castlefrank Elementary School $ 38,520.66 $18,999.00 $29,950.00 $69,635.00 $39,678.00 $22,943.00
Rockecliffe Park Public School $15,902.98 $29,999.00 $ 14,900.00 $55,250.00 $27,248.00 $11,410.00
Summerside Public School $21,518.59 $7,500.00 $10,650.00 $33,415.00 $18,476.00 No Bid

Trillium Public School $50,363.55 $31,999.00 $ 46,400.00 $59,430.00 No Bid $ 43,300.00

* These bid results are intended for information purposes only and do not consitute an award of any bid. Further evaluation will be

conducted by staff.

** The OCDSB requires the awarded contractor to submit 50% Performance Bond and 50% Labour and Materials Payment Bond for
every project where the tendered price is equal to or greater than $500,000 per site.

*** Prices are HST extra

****All cash allowances are included in the stipulated bid price




