o SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT DIVISION

L\\LJ Spreadsheet
INVITATION TO TENDER NUMBER 25-186

OTTAWA-CARLETON

oistrict scioor soaro Portable Classroom Reconnects

School Name Number of Portables Mike Fuller Four-O-One Gannon/Blackburn Lamarche 1663587 Ontario Inc. C&M Duplex Wired Svnerev Inc. | Drvcore Electric Inc
“ Electric Limited Electric Ltd. Electric Inc. Electric Inc. o/a Arc & Spark Electric Electric Ltd Enterprises Limited ynergy Inc. ¥
AY.Jackson S.S 2 $261,100.00 $259,200.00 $ 260,250.00 $267,865.00 $ 244,600.00 No Bid $ 234,000.00 $ 240,900.00 $ 81,600.00
Maplewood S.S. 6 $314,200.00 $357,420.00 $347,020.00 $339,135.00 $ 336,000.00 $ 350,000.00 $ 335,000.00 $330,500.00 $112,500.00
Richmond P.S. 1 $50,700.00 $ 375,800.00 S 56,490.00 S 54,525.00 $57,800.00 No Bid S 49,800.00 $ 53,900.00 No Bid
Severn Ave P.S. 1 $ 49,000.00 $58,125.00 $ 55,490.00 $63,225.00 $ 55,900.00 No Bid S 47,200.00 $ 52,500.00 $21,000.00
Wazoson P.S. 4 $ 308,900.00 $375,220.00 S 344,040.00 $287,585.00 $ 334,500.00 $ 355,000.00 $ 305,000.00 $330,800.00 No Bid

* These bid results are intended for information purposes only and do not consitute an award of any bid. Further evaluation will be conducted by staff.

** The OCDSB requires the awarded contractor to submit 50% Performance Bond and 50% Labour and Materials Payment Bond for every project where the tendered price is equal to or greater than $500,000 per site.

*** prices are HST extra

****All cash allowances are included in the stipulated bid price




